



# CITY CHRISTMAS DÉCOR BIDS

**August 20, 2019**

<b>FIRM</b>	<b>TREE</b>	<b>STOCKING</b>	<b>CANDLE</b>	<b>FREIGHT</b>	<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>NOTES</b>
<b>UNIVERSAL CONCEPTS</b>	\$13,125.00	\$12,950.00	\$11,025.00	\$1,500.00	\$38,600.00	
	35 @ \$375.00 EA	35 @ \$370.00 EA	35 @ \$315.00 EA			
<b>CHRISTMAS DESIGNERS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
	---	---	---			
<b>HOLIDAY DESIGNS</b>	\$10,500.00	\$10,850.00	\$9,450.00	\$300.00	\$31,100.00	\$30,000 IF ORDERED BY 8/27/2019
	35 @ \$300.00 EA	35 @ \$310.00 EA	35 @ \$270.00 EA			
<b>NORTHERN LIGHTS</b>	\$14,315.00	\$12,530.00	13,930.00	FREE	\$40,775.00	
	35 @ \$409.00 EA	35 @ \$458.00 EA	35 @ \$398.00			
<b>HOLIDAY LIGHT &amp; MAGIC, INC.</b>	\$18,081.00	\$12,989.90	\$13,755.00	\$4,125.35	\$48,951.25	
	35 @ \$516.60 EA	35 @ \$371.14 EA	35 @ \$393.00 EA			